

COUNCIL MEETING

January 8, 2018

The Paragould City Council met in regular session on Monday, January 8, 2018 at 6:00 p.m. in the Council Room of City Hall with Mayor Gaskill presiding.

The meeting was called to order with prayer led by Councilmember Charles Long.

Those present were Charles Long, Mark Rowland, Randy Aden, Josh Agee, Jeremy Biggs and Jackie Branch. Farrell Gibson and Susan Williams were absent.

City Attorney Allen Warmath and City Clerk Andrea Williams were present.

Councilmember Branch moved minutes from previous council meeting of December 26, 2017 be approved as transcribed; seconded by Councilmember Aden. All in favor.

REPORTS FROM BOARDS AND STANDING COMMITTEES:

Public Service	- None
Finance	- Councilmember Rowland stated the committee met at 7 a.m. this morning and will bring the budget for approval at the next meeting.
Parks and Recreation	- None
Police	- None
Public Health and Ordinances	- None
Fire	- None
Sanitation	- None
Street/Cemetery	- Councilman Agee stated the committee has item number two on tonight's agenda.

UNFINISHED BUSINESS:

None

NEW BUSINESS:

ITEM #1

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND CITY CLERK OF PARAGOULD, ARKANSAS TO ATTACH LIENS TO THE CERTAIN PROPERTIES LOCATED AT THE ADDRESSES SPECIFIED IN THIS RESOLUTION FOR THE PURPOSE OF COLLECTING MONIES WHICH ARE OWED THE CITY OF PARAGOULD FOR ENFORCEMENT OF CHAPTER 18 OF THE CITY’S CODE OF ORDINANCES.

Motion made that the resolution be offered by Councilmember Branch; seconded by Councilmember Biggs.

Roll Call: Long, yes; Rowland, yes; Aden, yes; Agee, yes; Biggs, yes; and Branch, yes.

Code Enforcement Officer Stephenson provided the council with documentation and photographs of the properties. No one appeared in opposition.

Motion made that the resolution be adopted by Councilmember Rowland; seconded by Councilmember Long.

Roll Call: Long, yes; Rowland, yes; Aden, yes; Agee, yes; Biggs, yes; and Branch, yes.
Motion carried six to zero. Ordinance adopted. (Ordinance No. 2018-01)

ITEM #2

PUBLIC WORKS YEARLY BIDS

Councilman Agee stated the committee met this evening to review the yearly bids for the public works department. (The recommend bid is indicated by an *.)

RECAP 2018

ASPHALT

ASPHALT	DELTA*	ATLAS
TYPE II (PER TON)		
LAI	\$74.50	NO BID
PLANT	\$52.00	NO BID
TYPE III (PER TON)		
LAI	\$74.50	NO BID
PLANT	\$52.00	NO BID
PRIME(PER S/Y)	\$5.00	NO BID
RECONSTRUCTION(PER S/Y)	\$3.75	NO BID

COLD MIX (PER TON)	\$85.00	\$95.00
BINDER		
LAI	\$74.50	NO BID
PLANT	\$50.00	NO BID
CSS I OIL (PER GALLON)	\$3.50	NO BID

RECAP 2018

CHAT

CHAT (PER TON)	MARTIN	VULCAN*	BOYD'S* (HAULING ONLY)
1/2"	\$11.00	\$7.50	\$6.50
SB2	\$9.00	\$6.30	\$6.50
RIP RAP	NO BID	\$9.75	\$8.00
LIME	NO BID	\$12.25	\$6.50
3" BALLAST	NO BID	\$8.00	\$7.00
HAULING	\$9.00	\$6.00	\$6.50
SHOT ROCK	NO BID	\$9.00	\$8.50
3/4" MINUS	NO BID	\$7.00	\$6.50
"B" STONE	\$25.00	\$7.00	\$7.00

BOYD'S: AS FUEL PRICES RISE I WILL RESERVE THE RIGHT TO RAISE HAULING PRICES ACCORDINGLY

BOYD'S: TAX IS FIGURED IN THE HAULING PRICE

VULCAN & MARTIN: ADD 9% SALES TAX TO ALL BIDS

RECAP 2018

CONCRETE

TYPE	NEAR*	HEDGER
3000 LB MIX	\$101.00	\$103.00
FIBER	\$4.00	\$5.75
1% CALCIUM	\$4.00	\$1.60
2% CALCIUM	\$8.00	\$3.20
PEA GRAVEL	\$111.00	\$106.00
60/40 MIX	\$101.00	\$0.00
3500 LB MIX	\$103.50	\$106.00
FIBER	\$4.00	\$5.75
1% CALCIUM	\$4.00	\$1.60
2% CALCIUM	\$8.00	\$3.20
PEA GRAVEL	\$113.50	\$109.00
60/40 MIX	\$101.00	\$0.00
FLOWABLE FILL	\$90.00	\$79.00

FIBER	\$4.00	\$5.75
1% CALCIUM	\$4.00	\$1.60
2% CALCIUM	\$8.00	\$3.20

HEDGER HAS
3 YD MIN. LOAD

RECAP 2018
CURBS

CURBS

GCE INC.*

PER LINEAR FOOT

\$10.00 CONCRETE INCLUDED
NO SIDE PREP

RECAP 2018

TILE

SIZE	CONTECH*	ADS*
12"	\$8.08	\$4.79
15"	\$9.70	\$6.26
18"	\$12.12	\$9.05
24"	\$15.35	\$14.41
30"	\$19.39	\$22.63
36"	\$29.09	\$26.74
42"	\$33.94	\$35.89
48"	\$38.79	\$46.00
60"		\$67.37

ITEM #3

POLICE POLICY

Chief Todd Stovall presented the council with a police policy regarding the usage of Intranasal Naloxone for narcotic overdose. Chief Stovall stated the police department is applying for a grant to provide each officer with this opioid antagonist to carry in their police cars. Chief Stovall stated this policy has to be approved before the grant will be awarded.

This medication will reduce the effects of an opioid overdose but will have no effect if the patient is having other medical issues. Dr. Kemp has agreed to be the medical control official and Captain Baldrige will receive training to train our officers on the use of Naloxone.

Motion made that the policy be approved by Councilmember Rowland; seconded by Councilmember Agee.

Roll Call: Long, yes; Rowland, yes; Aden, yes; Agee, yes; Biggs, yes; and Branch, yes.
Motion carried six to zero. Policy adopted.

ITEM #4

FIRE DEPARTMENT ACTIVITY REPORT FOR THE MONTH OF DECEMBER

Mayor Gaskill told the council that for the month of December, 2017 the fire department answered 28 fire calls, 23 citizen complaint calls, 10 public assist calls, issued 137 burn permits, made 55 business inspections, completed 503.39 training hours and made 3 educational visits.

ITEM #5

POLICE DEPARTMENT ACTIVITY REPORT FOR THE MONTH OF DECEMBER

Mayor Gaskill told the council that for the month of December, 2017 the police department took 1,105 incident reports, made 324 arrests (287 misdemeanor and 37 felony), opened 70 felony cases, wrote 319 traffic tickets and worked 83 accidents.

ANNOUNCEMENTS:

None

ADJOURNMENT:

There being no further business to come before the council, Councilmember Branch moved the meeting be adjourned; seconded by Councilmember Long. All in favor. Meeting adjourned at 6:21 p.m.


Paragould City Council

Mike Gaskill, Mayor

ATTEST:

Andrea Williams, City Clerk